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Russia hopes for a peaceful resolution of the situation in Syria's rebel-held province of Idlib
but believes it is up to Turkey to separate Islamist militants from the moderate
opposition, Russia's Syria envoy said on Tuesday.

"We are saying the situation in Idlib should be settled most preferably in a peaceful way. It is
possible to abstain from using military force," Alexander Lavrentiev told reporters after talks
in Geneva with UN envoy Staffan de Mistura.

"Idlib province is...a sort of zone of responsibility of Turkey; it is their responsibility to
separate the moderate opposition from the extremists, from Jabhat al-Nusra and other
groups, other terrorist groups," he said.

The northwestern province of Syria, described by the United Nations as a "dumping ground"
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for people evacuated and displaced from other parts of Syria during the seven year war, is the
last major holdout of the rebels.

President Bashar al-Assad has vowed to retake it, backed by his Russian and Iranian allies, but
the United Nations has warned that an offensive could lead to a humanitarian catastrophe,
potentially uprooting 800,000 people.

Related article: UN Calls on Russia to Forestall Syria Battle With '10,000 Terrorists'

The number of militants in the area was still extremely high, and some were using civilians as
human shields, but Lavrentiev said the military would seek to minimize civilian casualties in
case the battle went ahead.

There were also attacks from Idlib province on a Russian air base and on Syrian government
positions, which made the situation untenable.

But he said Russia's President Vladimir Putin and Turkish President Tayyip Erdogan were
working hard to find a solution. Russia and Turkey knew where the extremist positions were,
he said.

"It's extremely difficult for the Turks to complete their part of job," he said. "We are trying to
find a solution to this problem but as we see it this is really the only way. They should be
separated."

He said it was impossible to imagine the area being left in the hands of what he called terrorist
groups, with an enclave under their control, which would represent a threat to the region and
the world.

"Because today they are there, tomorrow they will be in some other countries, and in Europe
also, or maybe in the United States. That’s why it is necessary to eliminate them, as a
phenomenon."

Asked what he meant by elimination, he said: "If they surrender, that would be the best
decision." 
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